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Policy forum 
Parental resistance to childhood immunizations: clinical, ethical and 
policy considerations 
by Nancy Berlinger, PhD, MDiv 

School immunization laws in all 50 states provide for medical exemptions for 
children whose specific underlying health conditions, such as HIV infection, cancer 
or immunosuppressive therapies, place them at undue risk from one or more routine 
childhood immunizations [1]. In all but two states, “nonmedical” exemptions are 
permitted: 48 states permit exemptions based on religious belief, while more than 
one-third of those states also permit exemptions based on nonreligious personal 
convictions [2]. States vary in how they define “religious” or “philosophical” beliefs 
and in the standards of proof required of parents; in some states parents have been 
required to defend their beliefs at a “religious sincerity” hearing or to provide written 
documentation that their religious beliefs are incompatible with state immunization 
law. In other states they simply sign a form or check a box to claim a nonmedical 
exemption. This is an active area of legislation, with trends tending toward adding 
nonmedical exemption categories or making it easier for parents to obtain such 
exemptions [3]. States where it is easy to get an exemption tend to have the largest 
numbers of exemptions [4]. 

Nationwide, only a tiny percentage of parents—one percent is the estimate 
commonly cited by pediatricians—invoke nonmedical exemption. However, because 
families with similar beliefs may choose to live together, worship together, send their 
children to the same schools or be part of the same home-schooling networks, local 
rates of vaccination refusal may far exceed one percent. Parental refusal has been 
implicated in the development of “hot spots”: locations where the herd immunity 
provided by compulsory vaccination has been weakened sufficiently for disease 
outbreaks to occur. 

In Boulder, Colo., endemic pertussis (whooping cough) has been linked to 
vaccination rates of about 50 percent among children at a local private school [5]. In 
1991, a measles epidemic in Philadelphia that resulted in more than 500 cases and 
seven fatalities was traced to unvaccinated children whose families were members of 
two faith-healing churches [6]. Herd immunity can also be weakened in communities 
where large numbers of children are undervaccinated, having missed or not 
completed vaccinations due to lack of access to health care or frequent family 
relocations [7]. While undervaccination is a different public health problem than 
vaccination refusal, laws that ease nonmedical exemptions are of special concern to 
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physicians and public health officials in states with communities where 
undervaccination already threatens herd immunity [8]. 

The reasons parents seek or consider nonmedical exemptions may include strongly 
held religious convictions about faith healing, such as those characteristic of 
Christian Science [9]. The U.S. Supreme Court’s landmark decision on the limits of 
parents’ religious freedom in such cases states that the “right to practice religion 
freely does not include the liberty to expose the community or the child to 
communicable disease or the latter to ill health or death” [10]. This ruling is also 
relevant to cases in which parents claim a religious right to forego medical treatment 
for a child who is not suffering from a communicable disease. The classic example 
here is the Jehovah’s Witnesses’ prohibition on treatments involving blood products. 

When such cases arise, courts may intervene to protect the health and welfare of the 
affected children and, in cases where there is a risk of disease outbreak, to protect the 
health of the community in general. During the 1991 measles epidemic in 
Philadelphia, public health officials were granted a court order to immunize six 
children whose families were members of one of the faith-healing congregations 
identified as the source of the outbreak. 

Medical neglect 
“Medical neglect” refers to a parent’s failure to obtain adequate medical care for a 
child despite having the ability to do so [11]. The American Academy of Pediatrics 
regards medical neglect as a form of child abuse and neglect and opposes state laws 
that allow religious exemptions to child protection statutes [12]. What is unclear 
among physicians, legal scholars and bioethicists is how the concept of medical 
neglect applies to immunization refusal cases. Families with deeply held convictions 
concerning faith healing may not have strong or trusting relationships with health 
care providers in general because of the nature of their religious beliefs. In a public 
health emergency, there is the risk that characterizing as abusive or neglectful those 
parents who have refused to vaccinate their children on religious grounds will work 
against efforts to prevent or control disease outbreaks within or involving religious 
communities. The interests of these children and of other vulnerable children—
including those with medical contraindications—may be better served by ongoing 
efforts to strengthen herd immunity through vaccination campaigns, greater access to 
preventive health care in general, and strong epidemiological surveillance and public 
education programs. 

Resistance on nonreligious grounds 
Parental resistance based on philosophical or personal beliefs about immunization 
presents a somewhat different clinical, ethical and policy challenge. Many, perhaps 
most, of these parents have strong personal beliefs about the dangers of vaccines, in 
particular, the belief that childhood vaccines are linked to rising rates of autism. 
Some may not believe in the need for vaccines. This belief may co-exist with a 
preference for alternative medicine, may be the product of a lack of firsthand 
knowledge of lethal childhood illness (given that these parents themselves received 
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routine childhood immunizations) or may result from a lack of knowledge of how 
herd immunity works. Resistance to immunization may also be associated with 
opposition to perceived government intrusion into the lives of families and the rights 
of parents. 

Parents with these personal and philosophical objections to immunization may take 
advantage of “religious” exemptions simply because the latter are far more likely to 
be available under the laws of most states. While some of these parents join mail-
order or Internet “churches” to bolster their case for a religious exemption, it is not 
clear how much common ground they have with parents whose resistance to 
vaccination is an aspect of their religious faith [13]. 

Physicians’ role 
A recent survey of pediatricians’ attitudes toward families who refuse vaccines 
focuses on families whose philosophical refusals are based on safety concerns [14]. 
(The family whose refusals are grounded in a belief in faith healing, or whose 
children are undervaccinated rather than unvaccinated, might not have a pediatrician 
at all.) Where some professional caregiving relationship is in place, it affords an 
opportunity for education and conversation about the risks and benefits of 
immunization for the individual child and for the community. Physicians should take 
this opportunity, while bearing in mind the difficulty that even well-educated parents 
may have in sorting out fact from fear, given the extraordinary number of Web sites 
dedicated to this particular issue, and on the assumption that parents who refuse 
vaccines but otherwise attend to medical care for their children do so in the sincere 
belief that they are acting in the best interests of their children. Clinicians should 
help these parents understand and acknowledge that they are relying on herd 
immunity to keep their unvaccinated children safe from life-threatening disease. 
They can alert these parents to the fact that, while some individuals in a 
community—a child being treated for leukemia, for example—must be “free riders,” 
physicians have a duty to the public health as well as to individual patients to 
ascertain that parents understand the medical and social consequences of refusing 
immunization. And finally, family physicians can educate themselves about the 
extent of undervaccination in their communities, advocate for strong, well-funded 
immunization programs and remind policy makers that permitting nonmedical 
exemptions has public health consequences. 
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